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 *****FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE***** 

NEW  FRANKEN, WI –  November 2019 

Dental Health Products Inc. (DHPI) and TePe Oral Health Care Inc. are happy to announce a partnership by 
which DHPI is distributing TePe’s products in the professional channel in the USA. 

Mr. Stefan Vincze, General Manager of TePe in the US (www.tepeusa.com), said, “We are very pleased to have reached 
this agreement between TePe and DHPI. The synergies between DHPI’s distribution and customer service capabilities 
and TePe’s outstanding quality will serve our dental professional customers well. By broadening our distribution and 
increasing product availability, we make good oral health possible for more people.” 

About TePe  
TePe is a privately held Swedish company founded in 1965. Based on their vision, “To bring healthy smiles for life by 
inspiring good oral health”, the comprehensive TePe range is developed in collaboration with odontological experts and 
manufactured in Sweden. The steadily growing company is present with its own subsidiaries in eight countries and has 
distribution in over 60 countries.  

Another example of TePe’s close relationship with the dental profession is the Eklund Foundation, founded by TePe’s 
owners, the Eklund family, in 2015. It rests on a donation of €5.5 million and distributes funds to odontological research 
projects annually. Read more at www.eklundfoundation.org.  

About DHPI 
Dental Health Products, Inc. (DHPI) has been distributing products to the healthcare industry for nearly 30 years. 
Founded in 1991 by Dale Roberts, DHPI has grown from a home-based business to a nationally ranked dental supply 
distributor offering over 18,000 stocked products represented by more than 550 manufacturers. DHPI’s mission is "To 
provide personalized and timely solutions for our healthcare partners so they can continue to exceed their goals and their 
patients' expectations."  

One of DHPI’s core business objectives is to actively contribute to a variety of causes within the dental industry. In 
addition, they support the dental trade and foundations such as the DTAF and DentaCheques whose missions are to 
help the underprivileged gain access to basic dental care.   

Environmental Responsibility 
Besides a mutual dedication to people’s health, the companies share a passion for sustainability.  

TePe aims to conduct their work in accordance with the UN Sustainable Development Goals of Agenda 2030 and urges 
all users to dispose of products and packaging responsibly. TePe’s high-tech production facility in Malmö is powered by 
100% renewable energy. The company is engaged in the development of eco-friendly solutions and aim to shift to 
renewable raw materials in product and packaging. One step in this direction is the TePe GOOD line of products, made 
of bio-based plastics derived from sugar cane. Read more about TePe’s sustainability commitment at 
https://group.tepe.com/about-tepe/sustainability/. 

DHPI’s operations focus on sustainability and support those manufacturers that have similar business models. The 
company engages in protecting our resources by using environmentally friendly products and recycling materials 
whenever possible.  

The TePe range of interdental brushes, toothbrushes, and dental sticks is developed in collaboration with dental experts 
with the aim of promoting good oral health. All design, development, and production take place at the headquarters in 
Malmö. The products are marketed by subsidiaries in eight countries and distributors in over 60 countries, and available 
primarily through dental practices, pharmacies, and retail. TePe has 340 employees and turnover of MSEK 750 (2018). 

DHPI has been servicing the dental industry for nearly 30 years offering a full line of dental supplies, dental equipment, 
and dental solutions.  

For more information about DHPI, please call 800-626-2163 or visit: www.dhpionline.com 
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